X, INC. € R
4SBTR: IS ED 1T EMO
New York, NY 10108-0682 Date: 02/04/2015 Nos 30912

Phone: 1-212-683-9300 Terms: NET CREDIT
Fax: 1-212-683-9300

Salesman:HSE

To: THE HARODITE FINISHING CO.INC.
66 SOUTH ST .
TAUNTON, MA 02780

Quantity Description Price Amount

450 .000 CREDIT AGAINST INVOICE 30863 FOR 1..220 -549.00
GOODS DAMAGED .
STYLE V10836 WHITE 60"

Total Amount: -549 ,00




Wei Chang

From: Amanda Timms [AmandaT@harodite.com]
Sent:  Monday, February 02, 2015 3:33 PM

To: 'Wei Chang'

Subject: RE: 7122 ISSUES

Cut out defects.

Amanda Timms
Inventory Control
Harodite Industries
Phone — 864-834-9066
Fax — 864-834-9089

From: Wei Chang [mailto:wchang@warpknittricot.com]
Sent: Monday, February 02, 2015 3:32 PM

To: Amanda Timms

Subject: RE: 7122 ISSUES

Amanda:
Are these goods in rolls or all cut out defects?

Thanks,
Wei

From: Amanda Timms [mailto:AmandaT@harodite.com]

Sent: Monday, February 02, 2015 3:26 PM
To: 'wchang@warpknittricot.com'
Subject: RE: 7122 ISSUES

Good afternocon Wei,
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We have finished rerolling all of the 7122 we got in on my PO 14530. We lost a total of 450 yds because
of spots, runs and holes and other assorted issues. | believe | sent you some samples a few weeks ago. What you

we need to do to get a credit for these bad goods? Thanks for your help and have a great day.

Amanda Timms
Inventory Control
Harodite Industries
Phone — 864-834-9066
Fax — 864-834-9089

From: Wei Chang [mailto:wchang@warpknittricot.com]
Sent: Friday, November 07, 2014 11:18 AM

To: Amanda Timms

Subject: RE: 7122 ISSUES

Amanda:

Please send me the sample to:

2/3/2015



