
Subject Re: SBA

From Wei Chang <wei@veratex.nyc>

To claude <csimon@fairlane.biz>

Date 2022-01-11 10:19

I do not have the application and loan#.

CHP
5/12/20  $44900

Simons HK
4/24/20  $1000
5/11/20   $ 7000

Fairlane Vrtx
5/12/20  $11500

Veratex Inc.
4/24/20 $4000
5/12/20 $101800

On Jan 11, 2022, at 9:28 AM, claude <csimon@fairlane.biz> wrote:

I need the application number, loan number, loan date and loan amount for all 4 SBA loans.
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